
multisensory environment for adult artists with cognitive disabilities at a local non-profit 



are immersed within multiple interrelated contexts which facilitates an exploration of the 
influence of contextual embeddedness on social entrepreneurial practices. Through his 
research, Professor Pret expects to clarify the roles, relationships, norms, and constraints 
inherent within this ecosystem, explicate how these interact and potentially conflict with those 
of other contexts in which social entrepreneurs are embedded, and illuminate the process 
through which these myriad elements inform and are challenged by social entrepreneurs’ 
practices. As a result, this study will be able to advance understanding of the real-life issues 
facing social entrepreneurs and provide practical advice based on participants’ lived 
experiences.  
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"Nonprofit corporations as alternative public service delivery mechanisms in New York" 

Professor Scutelnicu’s research will take a closer look at a common trend in American 
governance, collaborations among public and nonprofit institutions delivering public services 
that affect local communities. The state of New York enabled the creation of special purpose 
entities called local development corporations (LDCs) with the purpose of providing services in 
the area of economic and community development. LDCs are nonprofit corporations, created 
by local governmen



the creek. This system can lead to the nutrient loading of waterways and coastal 
eutrophication, where low oxygen zones limit the abundance and distribution of marine 
species, and in addition can adversely affect the health of humans who consume fish and other 
aquatic life caught in these areas. Despite these circumstances, on any given day, hundreds of 
people can be found fishing, recreating, and bathing along Coney Island’s waterfront. Professor 
Toomey’s research seeks to identify the uses, values and meanings that local residents hold in 
relation to their waterfront areas, as well as the extent to which residents are aware of the 
ecological conditions of their waterways, particularly with regard to how water quality is 
impacted by sewage outfall. Moreover, her research also aims to better understand how these 
ecological and social factors influence the engagement of residents in civic stewardship and 
management of their waterfront spaces. 

 


